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Bhri 8. M. Banerjee: What are the 
positive steps taken  by the Govern* 
meat to solve or minimise unemploy­
ment?  May I know whether this step 
also includes  unemployment  doles? 
Jf it does not include unemployment 
doles, how are you going to solve this 
problem at all?

Shrl Nanda: Unemployment dole is 
not a solution to the problem of un­
employment  Therefore, we are not 
thinking in those terms. We are think­
ing in terms of  extending employ­
ment of various  categories and  the 
major  step  is  larger  investments. 
Even though  investment  is  on  a 
reduced scale in the Second Plan, we 
have doubled it as compared to the 
First Plan.

Shrl B. K. Galkwad: What is the 
latest estimate of  agriculturally un­
employed persons who  do not  get 
employment for about 8 to 10 months 
in the year?

Shri  Nanda: These  figures  are 
analysed  m  the  employment 
exchanges. I can furnish the details.
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Will the Minister of Commerce and 
Indoetry be pleased  to refer to  the 
reply given to Starred Question No. 
1365, on the 19th  March, 1959 and 
state:

(a) whether Government have since 
considered the Report of the Soviet
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Experts in connection with the setting 
up of production units of bask drags;

(b) if so, the nature of decisions 
taken thereon;

(c) the estimates for different pro­
jects to be undertaken; and

(d) the progress made so far, in the * 
setting up of plants for basic drugs?

The Minister  of  Indeetry  <Shri 
Manubhai Shah): (a) Yes, Sir.

(b) An agreement has been entered 
into with the Government of  the 
U.S.S.R for co-operation in establish­
ing State enterprises for the  manu­
facture of drugs, medicines and sur­
gical instruments.  Copies of  agree­
ment are available in the Parliament 
Library.  Government have taken a 
decision to proceed further with the 
Projects.

(c) and (d). Preliminary estimates 
in regard to these projects have been 
furnished to the House in the state­
ment laid on the Table of the House 
on 19th March, 1959.  Further work 
in regard to obtaining final estimates 
is proceeding  both  in  India  and 
U.S.S.R.

Shri Subodh Hansda: May 1 know 
whether the location of the basic drug 
plants has been finalized and, if so, 
the name of the place?  May I also 
know the various conditions and re­
quirements that have been taken into 
consideration in finalising this  loca­
tion?

8hii Mannbhai Shah: We expect the 
report of the Location Committee dur­
ing this month. And it is our policy 
that, given the overall economic con­
siderations, the heavy industry should 
be as much dispersed and decentra­
lised as possible, particularly in  the 
backward areas.

Shri Snbodh Haiisds: Can the Min­
ister give ua an  idea at the total 
amount of foreign exchange that will 
be required lor the setting tip of this 
plant?

Shri Maimhhal Shah: The loan, tt 
the House is aware,  Is  80 million
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8tarl Osman All Khan: May I know 
whether the Government expect re­
duction in the prices of the drugs as 
a result of this project and, if so, to 
what extent?

Shri Manubbai Shah: It would  be 
rather too early to say that, but our 
past  experience  has  been  very 
happy  The more we have gone into 
production the more we have been 
able to effect reduction of prices of 
every medicine, drug and other  in­
struments.
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Shri Namyanankotty Mcnw: May
I know if the Government is  aware 
that the Location Committee did not 
visit the State of Kerala at all and, 
if so, what were the reasons for this?

Shri MafiuMiai Shah: It is not neces­
sary for every committee to visit every 
area.  But a number of  memoranda 
have been received from the  State 
of Kerala and they have all  been 
placed before the Committee.

Shri V. F. Nayar:  May I know
which of the States have put forward 
claims for the location of the phyto- 
chemical plant and whether any de­
cision has been taken on that?

8hrl Maumbfcai Shah: The whole de­
cision will be taken on the basis of 
the report of the  Committee which 
we expect in the current month. The 
States which are prominently pleading 
tor the establishment of the  phyto­
chemical plant are Kashmir,  Uttar 
Pradesh, Kerala, Wect Bengal and an­
other S (n: 4 States.  Every State is 
practically asking far every project In 

fMr State.
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