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car which has been assembled from 
parts of different cars. 

Shri S. M. Banerjee: We are only 
concerned with khowing who are the 
owners of the cars the parts of which 
have been stolen. 

Mr. Speaker: Shri Yashpal Singh. 
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Sbri Alvares: Will Government 

~tate if this car assembled on the 
basis of small parts piracy can be 
produced on a mass basis? 

Mr. Speaker: Next Question. 

SIlrI KaPUr SiDgh: My question re-
mains unanswered. 

Mr. Speaker: That is a different 
tlUng from a car whiCh has been 
assembled in this way. 

Non-ferrous Metal Ores 

+ (Shri D. C. Sharma: 
I Sbri D. D. Pnri: 

*81. ~ SIlri Yasbpal Singh: l Shri Rameshwar Tantia: 
8hri Umanath: 
Shri P. J[llDIIan: 

Will the Minister of Steel and 
Mines be pleased to state: 

(a) whether the United States Gov-
ernment haVe been requested to con-
duct an aerial survey of the country 
to locate ores of non-ferrous metals 
which are in demand; and 

(b) if so, the outcome thereof? 

The Parliamentary Secretary to the 
M.btIster of Steel and Mines (8hri 
Thlmmaiah): (a) and (b). No Sir. A 
proposal for the intesive airborne 
survey 01 certain promising minera-
lised areas with the assistanCe of 

United States Agency for Inter-
national Development is undf'r con-
sideration of Government. 

Shri D. C. SIharma: What are the 
terms on which the negotiations are 
taking place? 

Shri Thiuunaiah: The U.S. AID 
had forwarded a scheme known as 
'Operation Hard Rock'. According 
to this, U.S. AID will appoint a firm 
of contractors who will be responsi-
bIe for conducting an aerial survey 
and will also follow up with the con-
current ground work. This will be 
done under the direction of the 5<>0-
retery of the Ministry. They will 
survey by air by means of aero-
magnetic and electro-magnetic e~uip­
ment areas where the minerals can 
be found. This will be followed by 
detailed examination by the explora-
tory team. 

According to the terms. this survey 
shOUld be completed within two 
years, for which we have to pay for 
the team; a provision of Rs. 2.05-
crores has been made .... 

Mr. Speaker: All the information 
need not be given under one ques-
tion. More supplementaries will 
follow. 

Shri D. C. Sharma: If this scheme 
is so beneficial to the country. why 
is the Ministry taking so long in get-
ting it through? 

Sllri ThimDiaia.h: It is almo.! aC-
cepted. The Finance Ministry a:50 
has given its acceptance. We are 
waiting for clearance from the Plan-
ning Commission. 
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Shri Nareu.dra Singh Mahida: May 

1 know whether there is a scheme to 
train Indian personnel for this sur-
'vey work? 

The Minister of Steel and MInes 
<Shri Sanjiva Reddy): In every place 

we will have one of our men to work 
as understudy. Therefore, by the 
time We complete the aerial survey, 
we will have a team of people who 
would have been trained. Apart 
from that, the aerial survey would 
only give a rOU!i':h idea. Later on, 
the Geological Survey and the Bureau 
of Mines will have to go and work 
in the field. Therefore, a rough idea 
will be given to us, and then our 
people will begin working. 

Dr. Ranen Sen: Was any other 
'Government approached in connec-
nectiOn with this aerial survey? 

Shrl Sanjiva Reddy: Yes, Sir, but 
it has taken a pretty long time al-
ready. Some years have been spent, 
and now this is in the stage of finali-
sahon. we do not want to go and 
waste a few more years. This is a 
very useful thinit. 

Shri ~ La! Sara!: • Have the 
overground and underground non-
ferrous metal ores prevalent in 
Jammu and Kashmir State been 
taken into consideration in this sur-
vey. and if so, what is being done? 

Shri Sanjiva Reddy: We 'have not 
yet selected any areas. The whole of 
India cannot be surveyed. We will 
have to pick up here and there some 
useful areas which have been loca-
lised by the Geological Survey and 
Bureau of Mines. Therefore, only 
small portions here and there can be 
mapped even by aerial survey. 

Shri Bihhuti Mlshra: I want to 
know the names of the areas to which 
special attentiOn will be given, and 
where survey will be made. 

Shri Sanjiva Reddy: 
not finalised them. 

We have 
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