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Tbe Minister of state In the Minis· 
try of 1I0me Aftalrs (Sbrl Bathl): (a) 
No, Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 
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Sbrl Bathl: I could not catch the 
,question. 

Mr. Speaker: He wants to know 
whether those commitments would 
be maintained or ..... . 

Shrl Hathl: Commitments made 
under the Constitution? 

Mr. Speaker: He has not asked 
.about the commitments made under 
the Constitution; he says about the 
-ommitments made by Pandit Nehru. 

Sbrl Hathl: Yes; Commitments of 
the late Prime Minister will be res-

ected. 
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Sbrl Mo:arka: Is there any truth in 

the report that though the policy of 
the Government is not to give more 
~han Rs. 10 lakhs by way of privy 

purse to the next generation, actu-
ally they have agreed to give Rs. 20 
lakhs so far as the Nizam is concern-
ed in the following generation? 

Shrl Hatbl: There is no policy as 
mentioned by the hon. Member that 
the privy purse more than R.. 10 
lakhs will not be given to successors 
of the then rulers who had signed 
the agreements. The agreements 
were that as regards those who were 
given more than Rs. 10 lakhs as privy 
purse on succession of their succes-
sors, the privy purse will be settled 
but it is not that it will not be more 
than Rs. 10 lakhs. 

Shrl Morarka: The operative part 
of my question was whether it hal 
been agreed to give Rs. 20 lakhs to 
the successor of the Nizam. 

Shrl Hathl: That was not the 
operative part. The operative part 
was whether more than Rs. 10 lakhs 
will not be given. This portion of 
the question which the hon. Member 
asks is correct, 
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L Sbrlmatl Renu... Barkatakl: 

Will the Minister of RebabiUtatioa 
be pleased to state: 

Ca) the number of persons who 
bave migrated to India from Ea.t 
Pakistan since 1st June, 1984; 

(b) whether the exodus is still 
""ontinuing; and 

(c) the action taken by Govern-
ment so far to rehabilitate the 
refugees stating the names of places 
where they are to be settled? 

Tbe Deputy MlnJster III the MIDls· 
Vy of RebabWtaUon (Dr. M. M. na.): 
(a) Out of a total number of 6,73,109 
persons who migrated from Ea.t 
Pakistan since January, 1964, 2,40,330 
persons have arrived since 1st June, 
1964. 

(b) Yes, Sir. 

(C) A statemenl indicating the full 
details of action taken is laid on the 
Table of the Sabha. [Placed In Lib· 
'f'aTli. See No. LT-3025/64j. 
982 (Ai) LSD-2. 1 ! ;: 
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Sbrl M. M. Das: We are trying to 
do our best in this matter. There 
might be more troubles in some of 
the camps. 
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8br1 IIldrajlt Gupta: From the 
statement I lind that .0 far the 1and 
which i. being acquired or received 
for rehabilitation of these people 
amounts to only 1.15 lakh acres. May 
I know how much land is actually 
required according to the Govern-
ment's assessment to rehabUltat .. 
them and In view of the fact that the 
Minister had once told thl. Parliament 
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that it would be done on a war foot-
ing, what are the difficulties in the 
way of acquiring sufficient land? 

Shrl 1'3'a,l: The land is not avail-
able. The bulk of the migrants are 
agriculturists. Therefore, I must 
make it quite clear that it is physi-
cally impossible to provide every 
family with agricultural land. At-
tempts are being made to give them 
employment in small industries and 
in other types of works like fishing, 
weaving, carpentry. etc. .I want to 
make it quite clear that it will not be 
possible to provide land to every 
family. 

Shrl N. R. Laskar: I would like to 
know whether there is proposal to 
start some major industries in Assam 
particularly in Cachar District for a 
large number of migrants who cross-
ed over t.o India and residing in 
different camps. 

Shrl Tyap: There are some pro-
sed over to India and are residing in 
Assam which are being examined. 
One of them is for starting coal min-
ing indust.ry and there are proposals 
for other bigger industries also which 
are under examination. The diffi-
culty in the case of thl. Ministry had 
been that, according to the view of 
my Ministry, the financinll of these 
big industries is the job of the Plan-
ning Commission or from the general 
funds. The Budget grant of the Re-
habilitation Ministry can be helpful 
to them to some extent by way of 
building residential houses and other 
things. 

Shrl Basumatar1: Since most of the 
refugees who have come from East 
Pakistan to Assam are agriculturists 
and tribals, may I know the amount 
of land found in Assam for rehabili-
tating them up till now? 

Dr. M. M. Das: It is not possible to 
give the exact area of land that wlll 
be available in A.sam. But the 
total area that has been offered to us 
by s""eral State. amounts to 1'15 
lakhs acres. 

Shrimatl ReDuka Barkatakl: May" 
know the rate of per capita doles 

and cash given to the refugees when. 
they were in the camp and when they 
were permanently rehabilitated? What 
is the total expenditure that the Gov-
ernment of India have incurred up. 
till now since January, 1964? 

Dr. M. M. Das: The total expendi-
ture incurred by the Government of 
India themselves directly amounts to-
Rs. 289.51 lakhs from January up till 
now and sanctions have been isued 
to the State Governments as granta 
and loans totalling to Rs. 461 lakhs. 

Shrimati Renu Chakravartty: In. 
view of the fact that a very large 
number of the refugees who have 
come from East Pakistan are tribals 
and are settled in Assam in the 
eachar area, may I know whether 
the area of Rs. 1.15 lakhs acres of 
land, referred to in the statement. 
includes the large stretches of land 
in NEFA and other border areas 
where these people can easily be-
settled? 

Dr. M. M. Das: This area of 1.15, 
lakhs acres of land comprises the 
lands that have been offered to the 
Rehabilitation Ministry on their re-
quest by the different State Govern-
ments. 

Shrimati Renu Chakravartty: 
wanted to know whether the large 
tracts of land in NEFA were included' 
in that area, and whether the Central 
Government were gong to rehabilitate 
these large number of tribal refugees 
in those areas themselves? 

Shri Tyap: Yes; the proposal about 
NEFA is also under examination. I 
am glad to inform the House that they 
have agreed to taking at Jeast one 
thousand families immediately. 

Shrl Bade: Is it a fact that Gov-
ernment were giving Rs. 70 8S dole 
per family bu t now they are dis-



Oral Answers BHADRA 18, 188ti (SAKA) Oral Amwers 

continuing it without glvmg any 
business or other occupation to the 
.naranar!h;", and if so, may I know 
what business or other occupations 
Government are going to provide to 
them? 

Dr. M. M. Das: Government are 
giving doles, the maximum of which, 
per family i8 Us. 70 per month, and 
this dole is given for two months; 
lhen, a gradual reduction is made 
from this amount, only when work 
is offered to them. 

Shri D. J. Naik: There are large 
areas in Dandakaranya which are 
available for this purpose. May I 
know whether any of these refugee 
families have been rehabilitated 
there? 

Dr. M. M. Das: Up to the end of 
March, 1964, 8244 families of old 
migrants had been taken to the Dan-
dakaranya. During March, April and 
May, 2104 families of new migrants 
have been taken to the various works-
centres of Dandakaranya. 

Shri Bhagwat Jha Azad: May I know 
what percentage of the refugees that 
entered India after lst January, 1964 
are according to Government's stan-
dards still unrehabilitated, and by 
what time, if any, Government pro-
pose to rehabilitate them? 

Dr. M. M. Das: The old hon. Mem-
ber is referring to the old migrants 
who came to this country before 
January, 1964? 

Shrl BhagwlWt Jha Azad: The hon. 
Minister has mentioned the figure 
since January, 1064. May I know 
what percentage of those who came 
after January, 1964 are still unre-
habilitated? 

Dr. M. M. D .. : Only a very few 
persons out of a total of about 6,73,109 
migrants who crossed to our country 
since January, 1964 have been reha-
bilitated; that i. ,some kind of emp-
loyment has been !<lund!<lr them. 
The rest are to be rehabilitated. 

Shrl S. C. SamaDta: Is it not a fact 
that there are no transit camps in 
West Bangal, and yet a good number 
of the displaced persons are staying 
back in West Bengal, and if so, what 
is the proportion of those persons, 
and have any educational facilities 
been given to them? 

Dr. M. M. Das: It is a fact that there 
is no transit camp in West Bengal, 
and a large percentage of tile new 
migrants are not leaving West Bengal 
but are living in West Bengal. 

Shrlmatl Renu Chakravartty: So 
many thousands are in Petrapole. 
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Sbrl ChaDdrabhaD SID,b: Is there 
any scheme to give these refugees 
para-medical and professional train-
ing like nursing, pharmacy, ward 
attendance, technician training, and 
laboratory assistant training? 

Dr. M. M. Das: Some refugee girls 
are at present being trained in the 
main hospital in Dandakaranys. 

Shrl ChaDdrabhaD SIDgb: I. there 
a scheme at Raipur Mana Camp? 

Mr. Speaker: No other question. 

Sbrl Trldlb Kumar Chaudbar\: May 
know the exact percentage of the 

refugees coming to West Bengal who 
have asked for government help and 
the relt who are staying in Welt 
Bengal? Has the State Government 
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asked for any grants or help for 
them in order to cope with the prob-
lem they have in hand? 

Shrl Tyagl: They have sent a pro-
posal for certain schemes, industrial 
and other. One of the biggest 
schemes they have sent is to give 
heavy loans to the transport corpora-
tion or C<lmpany there so that they 
might employ a large number of the 
locally settled migrants. 

Shrimati Savltrl Nigam: What was 
the average arrivals of refugees per 
day in the month of August, and are 
these refugees going to be rehabilitat-
ed in Andamans too? 

Dr. M. M. Das: The average arri-
vals of refugees per day are about 
2,000. There is a proposal before 
Government to find out the possibili-
ties of resettling more refugees in the 
Andaman and Nicobar Islands. 

Shrl Dlnen Bhattaeharya: May 
know whether Government would 
agree to the proposal of the West 
Bengal Government to recognise the 
persons who are coming as migrants 
but are not taking shelter in any 
camp as regular refugees? 

Dr. M. M. Das: The proposal of the 
West Bengal Government is under 
consideration. 

Shrl Mohammad Ellas: What are 
the possibilities of rehabilitating a 
large number of these refugees in the 
Andamans and Nicobars from where 
the people themselves have sent a 
representation that there is scope for 
settling 10,000 families? Has this 
question been examined? 

Shrl Tyaa\: Immediately after the 
rainy season is over, we intend sen-
ding a team to give us a detailed re-
port about the possibilities of rehabi-
tita ting refugees in the Andamans. 

has any attempt been made to take a 
cenSUs of their capacities and talents 
in trades or professions so that they 
can be settled that way if not in West 
Bengal, elsewhere? 

Shri Tyagl: A regular census is 
being taken. In fact. a pro forma 
has been issued to all transit camps 
and other camps to ascertain from 
each family as to what type of other 
work they would like to take up. May 
I make it clear, with your permission, 
that the idea is not just to go on 
giving them doles? Government's 
policY is to help them in resettling 
themselves. The initiative still vests 
in them. So, whatever industry they 
Rre prepared to take UP, Government 
will examine the possibility of giving 
them as much help as it can. 

12.00 hrs. 
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Mr. Speaker: No Minister to 
answer the Short Notice Question. 
That is not good. The Health Min-
ister should ·be here when she knows 
that there is a Short Notice Question. 

Shrl Sham Lal Saraf: Now that It 
has been made clear that these 
refugees cannot all be settled on land, 

'""'" wi'lft "'".., """" wi'lft 
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